PAZBID0001 - RFP Bid with Required Questions and Multiple Awards


	Project ID
		
	Application Name/Version
	ProcureAZ /Baseline Verx.x

	Date of Test
	
	Cycle/Pass #
	

	Author
	Ted Spencer
	Verifier
	

	Tester:
	
	Date Tested:
	



	Test Scenario(s)
	TSB001: Create a Bid from Scratch with required questions that vendors must answer when submitting a Quote. 
TSB004: Create a Bid that can be awarded to multiple vendors
TSB007: Open Bid, view quotes & attachment & award Bid to multiple vendors then issue the awarded purchase order
TSQ001: Create a Quote and make an offer on one item and ignore the other (no Bid)
TSQ003: Validate that quotes cannot be submitted after bid closes

	Test Cases
	TCB001: Validate that Vendors can reply
TCB002: Complete information on General Tab - All required fields
TCB005: Submit for approval
TCB006: Validate that the system does not allow Bids to be "saved & continued" without all required fields (date)  on the General Tab
TCB007: Validate that the bid cannot be viewed before the "Available Date"
TCB008: Validate that the Vendor cannot send Quotes to a Bid after the Bid Opening date (the date that all Quotes are due). 
TCB011: Status=Ready to send: Options, Send bid; Cancel Bid; Clone Bid, Print
TCB012: Validate Vendors can send Quotes 
TCB013: Validate BP can receive Quotes 
TCB017: Validate that Bids can be amended
TCB018: Validate that BP can view activity field on the Bidders Tab (the Activity shows the date & time the quote was submitted)
TCB020: Validate that required questions are required and that the "question type" is responded to correctly i.e., yes, no OR scale1-5
TCQ001: Validate Quote can be saved and then received a validation error "Terms and Conditions is not acknowledge"
TCQ002: Validate that a quote can be withdrawn and resubmitted prior to the close of the bid
TCQ003: Validate that Vendors cannot submit Quotes with missing required information [i.e., terms & conditions and/or required questions]

	System Environment
	

	Prerequisites
	3 Vendor IDs, Accounting Distribution for the selected Department

	Test IDs/passwords
	BP:

	Comments:
	This script tests deadlines for viewing bids and submitting quotes. While you will have an opportunity to amend the Bid to change deadlines if you are interrupted, it will help to read the entire script first to understand all of the deadlines that are tested.
A Bid may be submitted and approved but not seen by Vendors if the Available Date (and time) is still in the future. A Vendor can submit a Quote, withdraw and resubmit a Quote if it is after the Available Date but before the Bid Opening Date. The BP user can amend the Bid to extend the Bid Opening Date if necessary to open it up for more quotes.




	Step #
	Ref. No
	Action
	Expected Results
	Actual Results
	Pass Fail

	1.1. 
	
	Login as BP user by entering the Login ID & password  provided above in the Login Box
	ProcureAZ Home page  displays with the greeting “Welcome back <BP’s Name>
	
	

	1.2. 
	
	Select Documents  Bid  New
	Create a New Bid page displays
	
	

	1.3. 
	
	Select Create a bid from scratch.
	New Bid displays
	
	

	1.4. 
	TCB002
	Enter Description on General Tab – 
Short Descript = <script ID, Tester’s Initials>
	Text is displayed as typed
	
	

	1.5. 
	TCB006
	Click “Save & Continue” button at the bottom of the page
	Pop-up message tells you to complete next required field (e.g., Dept) that is incomplete.
	
	

	1.6. 
	TCB002
TCB006
	One at a time, enter Department and Location as prompted, then click Save & Continue.
	After each Save, a pop-up instructs you to complete a field.
	
	

	1.7. 
	TCB002
TCB007
	When prompted, enter Available Date as <now + 1hour> (to allow time to test unavailability)
	A pop-up message instructs you to complete a field.
	
	

	1.8. 
	TCB002
	When prompted, enter Bid Opening Date earlier than <now>. (This will cause an error).
Click Save and Continue.
	Pop-up message tells you that Bid Opening Date cannot be before now.
	
	

	1.9. 
	TCB002
TCB008
	Enter Bid Opening Date as <now>. (This will cause an error).
Click Save and Continue.
	Pop-up message tells you that Bid Opening Date has to be earlier than Available Date.
	
	

	1.10. 
	TCB007
TCB008
	Change Bid Opening Date to <now+2 hours>. Save and Continue.
	A pop-up message instructs you to complete a field.
	
	

	1.11. 
	TCB002
TCB006
	Complete the rest of the required fields as prompted by the pop-up:
Purchase Method=Open Market; Bid Method=RFP; Informal Bid & Item Single Award Only=Unchecked;
Additional fields=Tester’s choice.
Click Save & Continue at each entry. 
	Pop-up required field messages until final field is entered; cursor may take you to field. After final entry, page is refreshed.  Bid Number has been automatically assigned. General Validation Error “No items”
	
	

	1.12. 
	
	Click the items tab
	Items page, General tab is displayed
	
	

	1.13. 
	
	Click the “Add Item” button
	Open Market Bid is displayed to input first item being requested. 
Field “”Print Sequence*:”  =”1”
	
	

	1.14. 
	
	Complete the Description, Quantity, NIGP Class & NIGP Class Item fields. Text typed and/or selected  is Tester’s choice
	Text in the Description, Quantity, NIGP Class & NIGP Class Items fields are displayed as typed and/or selected.
	
	

	1.15. 
	
	Add a second Item, following the same procedure with the “Add Item” button.
	A second line is saved.
	
	

	1.16. 
	
	Click the “Save & Exit” button
	Open Market Bid Page displays at Items | General tab.
	
	

	1.17. 
	
	Click on the “Summary Tab”
	Summary page is displayed.  Warning: No bid bidder, and there is no recommended vendor at header level
	
	

	1.18. 
	
	Click the Attachments tab
	Attachments page is displayed.
	
	

	1.19. 
	
	Click “Add File”
	Add File page is displayed.
	
	

	1.20. 
	
	Use the Choose File and Upload buttons, one at a time.
Click Save and Exit after each. Complete for 3 attachments.
	Attachments page shows the uploaded files. 
	
	

	1.21. 
	
	Check the Delete box for one attachment, and uncheck the Show Vendor tab for another attachment. Click Save and Continue.
	Attachments page shows 2 attachments, one with Show Vendor checked.
	
	

	1.22. 
	TCB020
	Click on the “Questions” tab
	Questions page is displayed with an empty Question line.
	
	

	1.23. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question details:
Required = YES (checked)
Question=“Years of Experience”. 
Response Type =SCALE10. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is automatically numbered to 1. A new blank line is displayed.
	
	

	1.24. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question details:
Required = NO
Question=“Availability of items”. 
Response Type =AVAILABLE. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.25. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question details:
Required = NO
Question=“Past Performance”. 
Response Type =AVERAGE. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.26. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question:
Required = NO, Question = “Estimated effort (1=low, 5=high)
Response Type =SCALE15. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.27. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question details:
Required = NO, Question = “Hardware brands handled (250 characters)”
Response Type =COMMENT. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.28. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question details:
Required = NO, Question = ”Solution summary (4000 characters)”
Response Type =SCALE15. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.29. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question details:
Required = NO, Question = ”My company is certified on green technologies.”
Response Type =YESNO. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.30. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question details:
Required = YES (checked)
Question=” This quote shall be good for 30 days.”
Response Type =TRUEFALSE. 
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.31. 
	TCB020
	Enter new Question detail:
Question=”Delete this”
Click Save and Continue.
	Question is numbered. A new line is displayed.
	
	

	1.32. 
	TCB020
	Click the Delete box next to the “Delete this” question.
Click Save and Continue.
	Page refreshes; “Delete this” question is no longer listed.
	
	

	1.33. 
	TCB020
	Change the Print Sequence to reverse the last two lines, ignoring the blank line:
Change #7 Print Sequence to 8.0;
Change #8 Print Sequence to 7.0;
Click Save and Continue.
	Page refreshes; Questions are reordered according to the Print Sequence, but Question numbers remain unchanged.
	
	

	1.34. 
	
	Click the Bidders tab.
	Bidders page is displayed. Validation error “No bid bidders”
	
	

	1.35. 
	
	Click Lookup & Add Vendors at bottom of page.
	Pop-up window displayed to use for finding vendors.
	
	

	1.36. 
	
	Click on Find Commodity Codes for All Vendors on Bid at bottom of window.
	Pop-up window refreshes with a table of vendors using the selected NIGP Code. (If there are no vendors, choose a better NIGP code.)
	
	

	1.37. 
	
	Select 3 vendors; click Save and Exit.
	Pop-up window closes. Bidders page shows 3 selected vendors.
	
	

	1.38. 
	
	Click the Summary tab.
	Summary page displays. Validation errors may display if the Bid Opening Date is not later than the current time.
	
	

	1.39. 
	
	At the General tab, change the Available Date to <now+10 minutes> and the Bid Opening Date to <now + 15 minutes>. Click Save and Continue.
	General page displays, and times are reset.
	
	

	1.40. 
	TCB005
	Return to the Summary tab. Click the “Submit for Approval” button at the bottom of the page
	Confirmation message displays
	
	

	1.41. 
	TCB005
	Click the “OK” button on the “Are you sure” confirmation message
	Approval options page displays
	
	

	1.42. 
	TCB005
	Select “Automatic approval” option and click the “Save & Continue” button
	Open Market page is displayed.  Status = Ready to Send 
	
	

	1.43. 
	TCB011
	Check the available buttons on the Summary tab while the status is Ready to Send.
	Options include Send bid; Cancel Bid; Clone Bid, and Print
	
	

	1.44. 
	
	At the bottom of the page, click Change Bid Status to Send radio button. Click the Send button.
	Status=Sent
	
	

	1.45. 
	TCB007
	Log out as BP and immediately log in as a vendor. Go to the Bids tab and look for the just-published Bid.
(Tester: Click on “Seller” tab is not selected”
	Bid will not be visible until after the Bid Available Date that was set to be approximately 10 minutes after Submit.
	
	

	1.46. 
	TCB007
	After the Bid Available Date, look for the Bid (by the Short Description) and click on the Number
	Acknowledge Receipt and View Solicitation page displays.
	
	

	1.47. 
	TCB001
	Click Yes to acknowledge receipt.
	Bid displays.
	
	

	1.48. 
	
	Review the Bid details to see that they match what was entered, including the Item(s) and Questions. Confirm that the Required questions are marked. Confirm that only the Attachments marked to “Show Vendor” are listed.
	Page displays information as entered and does not display attachments that are not set to Show Vendor.
	
	

	1.49. 
	TCB008
	When it is after the Bid Opening Date/Time, Look for the Create Quote button.
	Create Quote button will not display. (Alternatively, you may see an error saying that the Bid is not open.)
	
	

	1.50. 
	
	Log out as the Vendor. Log in as BP. Return to the Bid (with Documents > Bids > Sent).
	
	
	

	1.51. 
	TCB017
	Click on the Amendments tab. 
	
	
	

	1.52. 
	TCB017
	Click on Create Amendment.
	
	
	

	1.53. 
	TCB017
	Click on the General tab.
	
	
	

	1.54. 
	TCB017
	Update the Bid Opening Date to <now + 1 hour> (to give yourself time to enter 3 quotes, withdraw and resubmit one before that time). Click Save and Continue.
	Bid Opening Date updated.
	
	

	1.55. 
	TCB017
	Click on the Summary Tab. Click the Apply Amendment button. Click OK at the Vendor Notification Result page.
	Summary page displays.
	
	

	1.56. 
	
	Logout as BP, log in as Vendor. Click the Bids tab on the Dashboard.
	Bid page displays details of the Bid.
	
	

	1.57. 
	
	Click the Create Quote button. (Must be before Bid Available Date)
	Quote page displays.
	
	

	1.58. 
	TCQ001
	Enter Delivery Days. Click Save and Continue.
	Validation errors to accept Terms and Conditions and answer Required Questions.
	
	

	1.59. 
	TCQ003
	Click the Summary tab. Look for “Submit Quote” button.
	Summary tab displays; Print and Cancel Quote are only buttons.
	
	

	1.60. 
	TCQ001
	Click the Items tab. Provide pricing (Unit Cost) for each item. Click Save and Continue.
	Pricing calculates Extended Amount for multiple quantities. “No Bid” boxes are unselected. Validation errors remain.
	
	

	1.61. 
	TCB020
	Click the Questions tab.
	Questions page displays.
	
	

	1.62. 
	TCB020
TCQ001
	Answer the first Required question. Click Save and Continue.
	[bookmark: _GoBack]Validation error remains until all required questions are answered.
	
	

	1.63. 
	TCB020
TCQ001
	Answer remaining Required questions and each of the optional questions. Click Save and Continue after the last one.
	Each question provides an answer set by type. Required Question validation errors go away. Terms & Conditions error remains.
	
	

	1.64. 
	TCQ001
	Click on Terms and Conditions tab.
	Terms and Conditions display.
	
	

	1.65. 
	TCQ001
	Click No for “Do you accept T&Cs?” Click Save and Continue.
	Pop-up requests that you enter exceptions.
	
	

	1.66. 
	TCQ001
	Dismiss pop-up. Click “Yes with Exceptions”, Click Save and Continue.
	Pop-up requests that you enter exceptions.
	
	

	1.67. 
	TCQ001
	Dismiss pop-up. Click “Yes.” Click Save and Continue.
	Page refreshes with no validation error.
	
	

	1.68. 
	
	Click Summary tab.
	Summary page displays with Submit Quote button (if before Bid Opening Date).
	
	

	1.69. 
	TCB012
	Click Submit Quote.
	Pop-up requests confirmation.
	
	

	1.70. 
	TCB012
	Accept the “Are you sure” confirmation.
	Quote status= Submitted
	
	

	1.71. 
	
	Log out as the first vendor and log in as a second vendor. Find the Bid and Click Create Quote. 
Click “Save & Continue”
	Quote page displays.
	
	

	1.72. 
	
	Click Items tab. Provide pricing for one item, click No Bid (or verify that it is checked) for a second line.
	No Bid box is not checked when a Unit Price is present.
	
	

	1.73. 
	
	Complete the Questions, Terms and Conditions, and submit the quote.
	Quote status = Submitted; action available to Withdraw Quote.
	
	

	1.74. 
	TCQ002
	Click Withdraw Quote.
	Quote status = Withdrawn
	
	

	1.75. 
	TCQ002
	View tabs on the Quote.
	None of the tabs are editable.
	
	

	1.76. 
	TCQ002
	At Summary tab, click Reopen Quote
	Quote becomes editable.
	
	

	1.77. 
	TCQ002
	At Summary tab, click Submit Quote.
	Quote status = Submitted
	
	

	1.78. 
	TCQ008
	Log out as second vendor, and Log in as a third vendor prior to the Bid Opening Date deadline. Begin a quote, but continue working on it until after the Bid Opening Date deadline.
	Once the deadline passes, there should be no further opportunity to work on the Quote or submit it. Error message displays “The quote cannot be submitted because the bid opening date <time> has passed.”
	
	

	1.79. 
	TCB013
TCB018
	Logout as vendor and log in as BP. Click Bidders tab, Quote Activity subtab.
	Quote Activity page displays vendors that received Bid or submitted Quotes.
	
	

	1.80. 
	TCB013
	Click Summary tab.
	Buttons = Open Bid, Cancel Bid, Clone Bid, Print
	
	

	1.81. 
	TCB013
	Click Open Bid button at bottom of page.
	Status = Opened; Buttons = Bid Tab, Cancel Bid, Clone Bid, View Bid History, Print
	
	

	1.82. 
	
	Click Bid Tab button.
	Bid Tabulation displays with Vendor Quotes in tabular form.
	
	

	1.83. 
	
	Click the Items tab. View the low bids and no bid indicators for each vendor and verify the accuracy.
	Low bid for each item is identified with **.
	
	

	1.84. 
	
	Select the check box for one vendor’s quote for one item, and another vendor’s quote for a second item. Click Save and Continue.
	Boxes stay checked.
	
	

	1.85. 
	
	Click the Summary tab. Review the award selections. Click Submit for approval, select Automatic Approval, click Save and Continue.
	Status = Bid Awarded
	
	

	1.86. 
	
	Click Create PO.
	Purchase Order Creation Preview shows that 2 POs will be created.
	
	

	1.87. 
	
	Click Continue.
	Purchase Order(s) Created page shows 2 POs created with links for each.
	
	

	1.88. 
	
	Click on a Purchase Order.
	Purchase Order opens at Summary tab. Validation error shows Accounting distribution is missing and required.
	
	

	1.89. 
	
	Click on the Accounting tab.
	Accounting tab displays with a blank row.
	
	

	1.90. 
	
	Provide Accounting as needed to complete test. Click Save Based on Percentage.
	If Accounting is valid, Accounting row is saved with 100.0 percent. A new blank row is added.
	
	

	1.91. 
	
	Click Rebuild All Items.
	Page refreshes. Validation error goes away.
	
	

	1.92. 
	
	Click the Summary tab. Review the award selections. Click Submit for approval, select Automatic Approval, click Save and Continue.
	Status = Ready to Send
	
	

	1.93. 
	
	At the bottom under Vendor Notification Actions, click the Set to Printed Status button. Click Save and Continue.
	Status = Sent 
(Note: If Agency and Accounting are not in interfacing system, a Validation error will result.)
	
	

	1.94. 
	
	End of Test
	Pass/Fails and unexpected results has been noted for each step and any issues have been  reported
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