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From: spo
Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2013 3:07 PM
To: spo
Subject: FW: Award of Statewide Contract for Armed / Unarmed Security Services
Attachments: Contact List.xlsx

SPO ALERT 
 

Effective August 15, 2013, the State Procurement Office awarded the following statewide contracts for Armed / Unarmed 
Security Services:   
 
ADSPO13-054354          Shetler Security Services        
ADSPO13-054355          AlliedBarton Security Services, LLC    
ADSPO13-054356          U.S. Security Associates, Inc.  
ADSPO13-054357          Surveillance Security Inc.       
ADSPO13-054358          Emerald Security Group          
ADSPO13-054359          BLACKSTONE SECURITY SERVICES INC         
ADSPO14-054367          CBI Security Service    
 
For convenience a contact list is attached. A separate tab contains the pricing for all vendors. 
 
All contract documents can be found at the State’s eProcurement website at https://procure.az.gov/bso/ and will be 
available as proper insurance documents are received.  
 
If you have any questions regarding this announcement, please contact Connie Schneider at 602‐542‐9190 or at 
Connie.Schneider@azdoa.gov.  
 
Thank you. 
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Region 1
(Maricopa, Gila, Pinal Counties)

 

AlliedBarton 
Security 
Services, LLC

Blackstone 
Security 
Services 

CBI Security 
Service

Emerald 
Security 
Group

Shetler 
Security 
Services

Surveillanc
e Security 
Inc.

U.S. 
Security 
Associates,
Inc.

UNARMED
Unarmed Security Services - 
Straight Time 13.70 12.35 13.83 16.60 15.47 14.50 13.83
Unarmed Security Services - 
Overtime 19.87 18.53 20.75 25.30 20.11 18.00 19.36
Unarmed Security Services - 
Holiday Time 19.87 18.53 20.75 25.30 20.11 19.00 19.36
Unarmed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 22.25 12.35 21.46 34.00 24.52 19.00 19.36
Unarmed Security Services - 
Shift Differential 13.70 12.35 13.83 16.60 15.47 14.75 14.58
Unarmed Security Supervisor 15.73 12.35 14.41 19.60 18.63 15.50 16.31
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 14.50 16.31 24.45 25.30 20.04 18.25 18.59
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 21.03 22.49 36.68 38.80 26.05 20.00 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 21.03 22.49 36.68 38.80 26.05 21.00 26.03

Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 23.00 16.31 31.16 52.00 31.83 22.00 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 14.50 16.31 24.45 25.60 20.04 18.50 19.34

ARMED
Armed Security Services - 
Straight Time 18.50 16.55 15.01 18.60 17.60 15.50 17.56
Armed Security Services - 
Overtime 26.83 24.83 22.52 28.30 22.88 19.00 24.58
Armed Security Servcies - 
Holiday Time 26.83 24.83 22.52 28.30 22.88 20.00 24.58
Armed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 28.50 16.55 23.52 38.00 26.40 21.00 24.58



Armed Security Services - Shift 
Differential 18.50 16.55 15.01 18.60 17.60 15.75 18.56

Armed Security Supervisor 20.50 16.55 15.58 22.60 20.45 16.50 18.80
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 18.50 20.51 25.73 27.60 21.71 19.25 22.32
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 26.83 28.79 38.60 41.80 28.22 21.50 31.25
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 26.83 28.79 38.60 41.80 28.22 22.50 31.25

Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 28.50 20.51 33.09 56.00 33.06 23.00 31.25
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 18.50 20.51 25.73 27.60 21.71 19.50 19.56

Region 2
(Mohave, La Paz and Yuma 

Counties)

 AlliedBarton 
Security 
Services, LLC

Blackstone 
Security 
Services 

CBI Security 
Service

Emerald 
Security 
Group

Shetler 
Security 
Services

Surveillance 
Security Inc.

U.S. 
Security 
Associates,I
nc.

UNARMED
Unarmed Security Services - 
Straight Time 14.55 12.60 13.83 16.60 15.87 No Bid 12.58
Unarmed Security Services - 
Overtime 20.25 18.90 20.75 25.30 20.63 No Bid 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Holiday Time 20.25 18.90 20.75 25.30 20.63 No Bid 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 23.00 12.60 21.46 34.00 23.81 No Bid 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Shift Differential 14.55 12.60 13.83 16.60 15.87 No Bid 13.33
Unarmed Security Supervisor 16.73 12.60 14.41 19.60 19.10 No Bid 13.83
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 14.85 16.56 24.45 25.30 20.44 No Bid 17.34
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 20.25 22.86 36.68 38.80 26.57 No Bid 24.28
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 20.25 22.86 36.68 38.80 26.57 No Bid 24.28



Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 23.30 16.56 31.16 52.00 30.66 No Bid 24.28
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 14.85 16.56 24.45 25.60 20.44 No Bid 18.09

ARMED
Armed Security Services - 
Straight Time 19.34 16.55 15.01 19.40 17.40 No Bid 13.83
Armed Security Services - 
Overtime 27.25 24.83 22.52 29.10 22.62 No Bid 19.36
Armed Security Servcies - 
Holiday Time 27.25 24.83 22.52 29.10 22.62 No Bid 19.36
Armed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 30.00 16.55 23.52 38.80 26.10 No Bid 19.36
Armed Security Services - Shift 
Differential 19.64 16.55 15.01 19.40 17.40 No Bid 14.58

Armed Security Supervisor 21.83 16.55 15.58 23.40 20.45 No Bid 15.38
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 19.94 20.51 25.73 28.40 22.04 No Bid 18.59
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 27.55 28.79 38.60 42.60 28.65 No Bid 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 27.55 28.79 38.60 42.60 28.65 No Bid 26.03

Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 30.30 20.51 33.09 56.80 33.06 No Bid 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 19.94 20.51 25.73 28.40 22.04 No Bid 19.34

Region 3
(Yavapai, Coconino, Navajo and 

Apache Counties)

 

AlliedBarton 
Security 
Services, LLC

Blackstone 
Security 
Services 

CBI Security 
Service

Emerald 
Security 
Group

Shetler 
Security 
Services

Surveillance 
Security Inc.

U.S. 
Security 
Associates,I
nc.

UNARMED
Unarmed Security Services - 
Straight Time 14.55 12.60 13.83 16.60 15.87 No Bid 12.58
Unarmed Security Services - 
Overtime 20.25 18.90 20.75 25.30 20.63 No Bid 17.61



Unarmed Security Services - 
Holiday Time 20.25 18.90 20.75 25.30 20.63 No Bid 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 23.00 12.60 21.46 34.00 23.81 No Bid 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Shift Differential 14.55 12.60 13.83 16.60 15.87 No Bid 13.33
Unarmed Security Supervisor 16.73 12.60 14.41 19.60 19.10 No Bid 13.83
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 14.85 16.56 24.45 25.30 20.44 No Bid 17.34
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 20.25 22.86 36.68 38.80 26.57 No Bid 24.28
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 20.25 22.86 36.68 38.80 26.57 No Bid 24.28

Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 23.30 16.56 31.16 52.00 30.66 No Bid 24.28
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 14.85 16.56 24.45 25.60 20.44 No Bid 18.09

ARMED
Armed Security Services - 
Straight Time 19.64 16.55 15.01 18.60 17.40 No Bid 13.83
Armed Security Services - 
Overtime 27.25 24.83 22.52 28.30 22.62 No Bid 19.36
Armed Security Servcies - 
Holiday Time 27.25 24.83 22.52 28.30 22.62 No Bid 19.36
Armed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 30.00 16.55 23.52 38.00 26.10 No Bid 19.36
Armed Security Services - Shift 
Differential 19.64 16.55 15.01 18.60 17.40 No Bid 14.58

Armed Security Supervisor 21.83 16.55 15.58 22.60 20.45 No Bid 15.38
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 19.94 20.51 25.73 27.60 22.04 No Bid 18.59
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 27.55 28.79 38.60 41.80 28.65 No Bid 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 27.55 28.79 38.60 41.80 28.65 No Bid 26.03



Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 30.30 20.51 33.09 56.00 33.06 No Bid 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 19.94 20.51 25.73 27.60 22.04 No Bid 19.34

Region 4
(Greenlee, Graham, Pima, 

Cochise, Santa Cruz Counties)

 

AlliedBarton 
Security 
Services, LLC

Blackstone 
Security 
Services 

CBI Security 
Service

Emerald 
Security 
Group

Shetler 
Security 
Services

Surveillance 
Security Inc.

U.S. 
Security 
Associates,I
nc.

UNARMED
Unarmed Security Services - 
Straight Time 14.55 12.10 13.83 16.60 15.87 13.50 12.58
Unarmed Security Services - 
Overtime 20.25 18.15 20.75 25.30 20.63 18.00 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Holiday Time 20.25 18.15 20.75 25.30 20.63 19.00 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 23.00 12.10 21.46 34.00 23.81 20.00 17.61
Unarmed Security Services - 
Shift Differential 14.55 12.10 13.83 16.60 15.87 13.75 13.33
Unarmed Security Supervisor 16.73 12.10 14.41 19.60 19.10 14.50 13.83
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 14.85 16.06 24.45 25.30 20.44 17.25 17.34
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 20.25 22.11 36.68 38.80 26.57 21.00 24.28
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 20.25 22.11 36.68 38.80 26.57 22.00 24.28

Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 23.30 16.06 31.16 52.00 30.66 21.00 24.28
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 14.85 16.06 24.45 25.60 20.44 17.50 18.09

ARMED
Armed Security Services - 
Straight Time 19.64 16.55 15.01 18.60 17.40 15.00 13.83
Armed Security Services - 
Overtime 27.25 24.83 22.52 28.30 22.62 19.00 19.36
Armed Security Servcies - 
Holiday Time 27.25 24.83 22.52 28.30 22.62 20.00 19.36



Armed Security Services - 
Emergency Call Out 30.00 16.55 23.52 38.00 26.10 21.00 19.36
Armed Security Services - Shift 
Differential 19.64 16.55 15.01 18.60 17.40 15.25 14.58

Armed Security Supervisor 21.83 16.55 15.58 22.60 20.45 16.50 15.38
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Straight Time 19.94 20.51 25.73 27.60 22.04 18.25 18.59
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Overtime 27.55 28.79 38.60 41.80 28.65 21.00 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Holiday Time 27.55 28.79 38.60 41.80 28.65 22.00 26.03

Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Emergency Call Out 30.30 20.51 33.09 56.00 33.06 22.00 26.03
Vehicle Patrol Security Services -
Shift Differential 19.94 20.51 25.73 27.60 22.04 18.50 19.34




